
‣ABOUT THE COMPANY 

We make emotion driven technology. 
We know the latest mechanics – tech-
nology is our heritage. But moreover, 
we understand the poetry of light. 
We have spent the last three decades 
helping our customers discover a 
whole new level of meaning in lighting. 
Whether looking for the right ready-
made components, elegant design 
fixtures or completely tailormade solu-
tions.


‣THE NEED 
As company has grown Saas Instru-
ments have faced needs that have 
been solved with Standard ERP. One 
of their main customers requested EDI 
connection for automation of order 
process. This was done in cooperation 
with HansaWorld partner X3msoft and 
have now been in use since 2016. 
Next step is developing EDI connec-
tion to new platform and upgrading it 
to a two-way connection.  

Another big need for Saas Instruments 
is management of production process-
es and warehouse management. Lat-
est project has been implementation of 
production module, which have been a 
big change to the right direction re-
garding reporting and time manage-
ment.  was automated financial report-
ing. 

“We have used spreadsheets for a lot 
of reporting, which we have now more 
efficiently in Standard ERP ation with 
partner and HansaWorld Finland” 


‣THE SOLUTION 
First touch with HansWorld product in 
2000 with HansaFinancials. Have used 
HansaWorld’s product more and more 
as company has grown. Have today 
over 10 users and using Standard ERP 
for all business processes. Latest 
project have been implementing pro-
duction module to make reporting and 
production actions more efficient. 

“We have done cooperation directly 
with HansaWorld and with partners. 
Todays aim is to have efficient cooper-
ation with partner and HansaWorld Fin-
land”


The business


Tailor-made lighting solutions


Location


Helsinki, Finland


Webpage


https://saas.fi/en/


Key Functionality


• Standard ERP


• Ten users


• Production module


• Pricing module


• EDI


• E-invoicing


• Nominal Ledger


• Sales Ledger


• Purchase Ledger


• Quotations


• Sales and Purchase Orders


• Logistics


Favourite features


• Drill-down functionality


• Item Status Bar


• Price list management


• Shortcuts


www.hansaworld.com

SAAS INSTRUMENTS


HOW TO INTEGRATE ALL BUSINESS PROCESSES IN TO 
ONE SOLUTION TO MAKE BUSINESS SMOOTHER



www.hansaworld.com


